
3.30pm - 5.30pm

Hot tea

£12.30

Main Session

After Clubs Session*

4.30pm - 5.30pm

Packed tea

£7.50

Extended Session**

5.30pm - 6.15pm

£4.75

Wrap-Around Care

At Lingfield Prep, we provide wrap-
around care options delivered by our
friendly and experienced staff so that
your child is happy and looked after
throughout the whole day.

BREAKFAST SESSIONS

Breakfast sessions are available to all
Prep School years from 7.30 am every
morning in the Prep School dining room,
where classroom assistants will supervise
children and accompany them to their
class. 

On offer will be a choice of cereals, fruit,
toast or a cooked breakfast with a
selection of refreshments. Parents are
welcome to have breakfast too. 

AFTER SCHOOL SESSIONS

TeaRex Club operates daily throughout
the term from the end of the timetabled
school day in Orchard Lodge. 

There is a range of fun and exciting
activities available. Children can choose
to be active outside on our beautiful
grounds, to be creative with arts and
crafts or enjoy our many toys and games.

**Can only be booked in conjunction with one of the other sessions. 

7.30am - 8.30am

Breakfast

£7.85

Breakfast Sessions

Book via email
prepoffice@lingfieldcollege.co.uk

Book via SchoolPost email sent out
at the start of term.

Email tearex@lingfieldcollege.co.uk

*If your child is going straight from Study Club to TeaRex at 
5.00 pm, the After Clubs Session fee is applicable.



Holiday Clubs

Hot lunch included

HOLIDAY CAMP

Based on the Prep School grounds, the
holiday camp benefits from our beautiful
facilities and outdoor areas. Available to
children in Reception to Year 7, activities
include arts and crafts, team sports,
forest school, cooking, adventure
playgrounds, cycling and much more. 

EXTERNAL PROVIDERS

Drop-in clubs and activities are also
available during the holidays. Visit our
website for details lingfieldcollege.co.uk.
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8.30am - 3.30pm

Extended 3.30pm - 5.30pm

£44 / £60.50 (extended) per day

£5 sibling discount per child per day

Packed tea available for £2.50 for
the extended session. 

Book via our 'Holiday Clubs' page
on our website lingfieldcollege.co.uk


